neToR VEGHICLES ACCIDENT ClLAM (MALT)
PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 49 @\A’%)
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)
PART 111
GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORT
(TRANSPORT -II BRANCH)
NOTIFICATION

The 16th March , 2015

No. G.S.R. 10/C.A.59/1988/Ss.28, 65 and 96/Amd./2015.- The
following draft of rules further to amend the Punjab Motor Vehicles Rules,
1989, which the Governor of Punjab proposes to make in exercise of the power
conferred by sections 28, 65 and 96 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central
ActNo. 59 of 1988), and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, is published
as required by sub-section (1) of section 212 of the said Act, for the information
of the persons likely to be affected thereby.

Notice is hereby given that the draft will be taken into consideration by
the Government on or after the expiry of a period of thirty days from the date
of publication of this notification'in the Officiai Gazette, together with any
objection or suggestion, which may be received by the Secretary to Government
of Punjab, Department of Transport , Mini Secretariat, Sector-9, Chandigarh,
from any person, before the expiry of the pericd so specified, with respect to
the said draft, namely:-

DRAFT RULES

1. These rules may be called the Punjab Motor Vehicles (Amendment)
Rules, 2015,

2.  Inthe Punjab Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989 (hereinafter referred to as the
said rules), in rule 6, in sub rule (5), for the word “ten”, the word * one
hundred” shall be substituted.

3. Inthe said rules, in rule 8, in sub rule (1), for the word “ ten”, the word
“twenty- five” shall be substituted.

4. Inthe said rules, in rule 10, in sub-rule (4) ,for the words “ twenty five”,
the words “one hundred” shall be substituted.

5. Inthe said rules, in rule 11, in subrule (4), for the word “ ten”, the words
“ one hundred” shall be substituted.



——

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 50
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

6.  Inthesaid rules, in rule 18, in sub-rule (2), for the word ten”, the words
“ five hundred” shall be substituted.
7. Inthe said rules, in rule 28, in sub rule (1), for the word « twenty”, the
words “ two hundred” shall be substituted.
8. Inthesaid rules, in rule 29, in sub rule (3), for the word “ ten”, the words
“five hundred™ shall be substituted.
9. Inthe said rules, in rule 35, in sub rule (1), for the word twenty”, the
words “ two hundred” shall be substituted.
10.  Inthe said rules, in rule 39 A, for the existing ratio given in the tabulator
form, the foilowing rates shall be substituted, namely:-
“ Period of Delay Amount of Penalty
(a) For each day up to 15 days Rupees twenty per day, subject to
maximum of rupees one hundred.
(b) More than 15 days up to Rupees twenty per day, subject to
3 months maximum of rupees one thousand.
(c) More than 3 months up to Rupees twenty per day, subject to
6 months maximum of rupees two thousand.
(d) More than 6 months up to Rupees twenty per day, subject to
one year maximum of rupees four thousand.
{e) More than one year Rupees four thousand per year, and
rupees twenty, for each additional day.”.
1. Inthe said rules, in rule 42,in sub -rule (10), in the proviso, for the word
“ fifty”, the word “ one hundred” shall be substituted.
12.  Inthe said rules, in rule 47, for the existing rates given in the tabular form,
the following rates shall be substituted, namely :-
For vehicles other  For transport
than transport vehicle
vehicle
(in rupees) (in rupees)
“() for delay not exceeding Fifty One hundred

three months




PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 51
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

(ij) for delay exceeding three One hundred Two hundred
months but not exceeding
six months

(i) for delay exceeding six One hundred fifty = Three hundred

months but not exceeding
twelve months

(iv) for delay exceeding one Two hundred Four hundred
year but not exceeding
two years

(v) fordelay exceeding two Twohundred fifty  Five hundred.”.
years

13. Inthe said rules, in rule 51, for the exiting rates given in the tabular form,

the following rates shall be substituted, namely:-

“Period of delay Amount of penalty

(a) for delay exceeding thirty days but not Rupees fifty
exceeding three months

{b) for delay exceeding three months but Rupees one hundred
not exceeding six months

(c) fordelay exceeding six months but not Rupees two hundred
exceeding nine months

(d) fordelay exceeding nine months but not Rupees three hundred
exceeding twelve months

(e) for delay exceeding one year but not Rupees four hundred
exceeding two years

(f) for delay exceeding two years Rupees five hundred”

14, In the said rules, in rule 65, in sub-rule (2) , for the word and sign

15.

“Authority.”, the word and sign “Authority:” shall be substituted and
thereafter, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that not more than twenty five percent of the existing
fleet of the permit holder (i.e. big buses), shall be kept as reserve
stage carriage.”.

In the said rules, in rule 67, for the existing rates given in the tabular



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 52
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

form, the following rates shall be substituted, namely:-

“Description of Motor Vehicles

Rate of Fee

]

A (a) Buses Rupees ten thousand
{b) Mini Buses Rupees two thousand
(c) Tourist Maxi Cabs/ Maxi Cabs Rupees five hundred
(for operation in Punjab Territory)
(d) Motor Cabs (for operation in Punjab  Rupees three hundred

Territory)/ Tourist Motor Cabs

(e) Three Wheeler (passenger)

Rupees two hundred

(f) Goods Carriage Rupees five hundred
(g) Other Vehicles Rupees two hundred

B (a) Fora Special Permit Rupees one hundred and fifty
(b) For temporary permit for two days Rupees one hundred and fifty

C Fee for duplicate permit

Rupees two hundred.”.

16. In the said rules, in rule 68-

(a) insub- rule (1), for the existing rates given in the tabular form, the

following rates shall be substituted, namely:-

“Description of Motor Vehicles

Rate of Permit Fee per year

For each For whole of
region the state of
Punjab
1 2 3 4
1 (a) Buses - Rupees one
thousand
(b) Mini Buses --- Rupees seven
hundred and
fifty
(c) Tourist Maxi Cabs/ Maxi Cabs Rupees two ——--
(for operation in Punjab Territory) hundred and

fifty




PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 53
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

(d) Motor Cabs (for operation in Rupees two R—
Punjab Territory)/ Tourist hundred
Motor Cabs
(e} Three Wheeler (passenger) Rupees three
hundred
(f) Goods Carriage (Heavy) - Rupees seven
hundred
(g) Goods Carriage (Light/ Medium)  ---- Rupees five
_ hundred
(h) Goods Carriage (Tractor Trolley) Rupees three — ---
hundred within
radius of
25 KM from
the residence
of permit
holder
() Other Vehicles Rupees two -—---
‘ hundred
(1) Fee for a Special/ temporary ---- Rupees two
Permit up to one week and for hundred and
each subsequent week or part fifty™.

thereof.

(b) insub-rule{2), forthe existing rates given in the tabular form, the
following rates shall be substituted, namely:-

“Description of Motor Vehicles

Rate of counter-signature fee per year

Foreachregion  For whole of the

State of Punjab
(a) Buses Rupees one --
thousand
{b) Mini Buses Rupees seven -
hundred and fifty
(c) Goods carriage Rupees five ---
hundred

(d) Motor Cabs/ Goods Carriage
{Light/ Medium)

- Rupees seven
hundred




PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 54
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

(e) Three Wheelers (Passenger) Rupees three --

hundred and fifty

(f) Maxi Cabs -- Rupees twelve
hundred

(g) Private Service Vehicle -- Rupees twelve
thousand”.

17  In the said rules, in rule 68-A, for the existing rates given in the tabular

form, the following rates shall be substituted, namely:-
“Period of delay Amount of Penalty
(a) for each day up to 15 days Rupees twenty per day, subject to

maximum of rupees one hundred

(b) More than 15 days up to 3 months  Rupees twenty per day, subject to

maximum of rupees one thousand

(c) More than 3 months up to 6 months Rupees twenty per day, subject to

maximum of rupees two thousand

(d) More than 6 months up to one year Rupees twenty per day, subject to

maximum of rupees four thousand

(e) More than one year Rupees four thousand per year and

rupees twenty for each additional

»

day”.

18.

19.

20.

2L

22.

23.

In the said rules, in rule 77 , in sub-rule (4),for the word “fifty”, the
words * two hundred” shall be substituted.
In the said rules, in rule 83, in sub- rule (5), for the words “one hundred”,
the word “ two hundred and fifty” shall be substituted.

In the said rules, in rule 85, in sub-rule (1), for the words “ one hundred”,
the words “ five thousand” shall be substituted.
In the said rules, in rule 94, in sub- rule (3) for the word “fifty”, the
words “ five hundred * shall be substituted.
In the said rules, in rule 98,in sub -rule (2), for the word “twenty”, the
words * two hundred” shall be substituted.

In the said rules, in rule 110, in sub- rule (2), for the word “thirty” ,the
words “rupees three hundred” shall be substituted.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 55

(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

24. In the said rule , for rule 113, the following rule shall be substituted

namely:-

*“ 113 . Fee for a licence — Fee for the grant or renewal of a licence under
rule 110, or rule 112 shall be follows :-

a) forthe grant of principal licence

b) for the grant of supplementary licence
for each additional establishment or

Sub-agency.

c} Forrenewal of a licence if application is

made in time —

i)
ii)

Principal licence

Supplementary licence for each
Additional establishment or
sub-agency

d) Penalty for renewal of licence if application

is not made in time but is made before the

expiry of licence —

Y

i) Principai Licence :-

if)

a)
b)

d)

If application is made late by seven days
If application is made late by more than
Seven days, but not more than fourteen
Days.

If application is made late by more than
Fourteen days but not more than thirty
Days.

If the application is made late by more
than twenty-one days but not more

than Thirty days.

Supplementary Licence —

a)

b)

If the application is made late by
Fifteen days

If the application is made late by
more than fifteen but not more
than Thirty days.

Rs. 5000.00
Rs. 500.00

Rs. 5600.00
Rs. 500.00

Rs. 500.00
Rs. 500.00

Rs. 500.00

Rs.2000.00

Rs.200.00

Rs. 300.00






<t

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), MARCH 25, 2015 56
(CHTR 4, 1937 SAKA)

Note - In this rule, the expression “Principal Licence” means a licence for

25.

the headquarters of a person engaged in the business of collecting,
forwarding or distributing goods carried by goods carriages and
“Supplementary Licence” means a licence which is for a branch
office.

In the said rules, in rule 139,for sub rule (2), the following rule shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(2) The motor vehicles belonging to educational institutions, -

() shall be painted with golden yellow colour {as approved by the Bureau
of Indian Standards, from time to time). For identification of the school
bus concerned, there shall be a band of 150mm width, in golden brown
color (duly approved by the said Bureau), on all over the body of the bus,
below the window level. The school bus insignia, shall also be drawn on
the golden yellow back drop, in the scale of 350mm x 350mm, in black
colour;

(i) school bus shall be written in capital and bold letters in front and
rear side of the bus, preferably on the window screen safety glass on
golden yellow background, in front side, and on the rear side, on the body
of the bus above window screen {on the said back ground of golden
yellow colour), in black colour;

(iii) the telephone number and complete address of the school concerned
shall also be written on the bus,-

(a) on both sides; and
(b) on back side, at a clearly visible space; and

(iv) the school bus must have a First-Aid Box.”

Sd/-
ANURAG AGARWAL,

Chandigarh Secretary to Government of Punjab

The

2015 Department of Transport.

735/03-2015/Pb. Govt.-Press, S.A.S. Nagar






